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Low Achievement exemplar for 90851 / 2014 Total score 07 

Q Grade 
score Annotation 

1 A3 

The candidate has briefly explained a change in the relationship with a single 
focus on Mr Taylor’s perspective in 1 (c). The candidate attempts to address 
the ‘throughout the text’ component of the question with two examples drawn 
from the beginning and end of the text. 

Sarcasm is the only technique identified in 1 (b). 

The ‘how’ component has not been adequately addressed.  

2 N2 

Personification has been correctly identified with an accurate example in 2 (a), 
but the discussion of how this feature helps with an understanding of the 
experience is non-specific and inadequate. The candidate begins a discussion 
on contrast and uses two examples in 2 (c), but there is no explanation of 
effect.  

3 A3 

The candidate shows an understanding of the way metaphor (3 (b) “shady 
pack of wolves”) helps us understand the writer’s ideas about being safe on 
the Internet ‘”by exaggerating the dangers”). The candidate mentions jargon 
and listing, but with superficial explanations. 
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Achievement exemplar for 90851 / 2014 Total score 10 

Q Grade 
score Annotation 

1 A4 
The candidate has addressed the question by briefly exploring a number of 
aspects of the Archie–Colin relationship with examples and the techniques 
used: repetition, hyperbole, minor sentences, use of laughter / jokes, metaphor.  

2 A3 
The candidate shows some understanding of the way some techniques 
(personification, change of mood) help describe experiences at the estuary. 
The response does not go beyond brief comments on each technique. 

3 A3 

The candidate identifies a range of techniques with examples: eg: 3 (c) “uses 
facts and percentages 17%, 55%, 100%”, but in some instances with limited 
accompanying commentary: “This shows the audience he has researched it 
and knows exactly what he is talking about.” 

The candidate’s attempt in places to go beyond the text and give their own 
views on internet safety do not enhance the answer: 3 (c) “This shows that this 
happens all over the world and it’s a scam.” 

 

  




